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OLD MISSION INVESTMENT COMPANY, LLC

Old Mission Investment Company, LLC
880 Munson Ave, Suite B
Traverse City, MI 49686

Phone (231) 929-4100 Fax (231) 929-4190
www.omico.net

 FORM ADV - PART 2A
Disclosure Brochure

 May 21, 2025 

This brochure provides information about the qualifications and business practices of Old Mission 
Investment Company ("Old Mission"). If you have any questions about the contents of this brochure, 
please contact us at (231) 929-4100. The information in this brochure has not been approved or 
verified by the United States Securities and Exchange Commission ("SEC") or by any state securities 
authority.

Additional information about Old Mission Investment Company LLC, including a copy of its Form ADV 
Part 1, is available on the SEC's website at www.adviserinfo.sec.gov.
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Item 2 Material Changes 
 
The S.E.C. issued a final rule in July 2010 requiring investment advisors to provide a Firm Brochure in 
narrative "plain English" format. This new final rule identifies sections of an advisor's business which 
needs to be discussed. This narrative brochure of our form ADV Part 2 reflects the final rule.
 
The Material Changes section of this brochure will be updated annually when material changes occur 
since the previous release of the Firm Brochure.
 
Since the filing of our last annual updating amendment dated February 5, 2024, we have no material 
changes to report.
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Item 4 Advisory Business 
 
Firm Description: Old Mission Investment Company LLC was founded in 2006 based on the efforts of 6
individual principals following their departure from a national investment and brokerage firm. Old 
Mission Investment Company is considered to be a fee-based investment advisory firm.
 
As an independent investment advisory firm, Old Mission Investment Company does not offer 
proprietary products of its own. We provide investment management services to a variety of clients 
including, but not limited to trusts, individuals, retirement plans, pension plans by managing portfolios 
of mutual funds, exchange traded funds, individual stocks and individual bonds. We work closely with 
clients to formulate financial, estate, and investment plans that emphasize focusing on their entire 
financial picture, rather than solely on investment management needs. Each portfolio is structured to 
meet the needs of the client through careful risk profiling in order to meet the safety, liquidity, growth or
income needs of our client.
 
At present, Old Mission Investment Company has 4 principal members, with all members participating 
in the investment management, and overall management of the firm.
 
Types of Advisory Services:
 
Old Mission Investment Company works with clients' investment portfolios with specific investment 
objectives. Each client provides a summary risk profile detailing their risk preference on a short-term, 
intermediate term, and long-term basis. Each client portfolio is customized based on their overall 
needs. We may utilize individual securities such as individual stocks, taxable or tax-free municipal 
bonds, no-load or load waived mutual funds or exchange traded funds to meet their objectives.
 
Customized Relationships: Old Mission Investment Company makes every effort to create a 
customized investment solution for each client relationship. This may take the form of retaining certain 
assets for tax purposes, holding additional amounts of cash based on goal-based needs, or their 
preference toward risk on both a short-term and intermediate-term basis. During our initial meeting, we
may make every effort to obtain tax records, personal financial summaries, and past investment 
histories in efforts to create a personalized investment plan for the client.
 
Old Mission Investment Company prefers to manage investment accounts on a discretionary basis. 
However, there are times where the individual client may engage our firm on a non-discretionary basis,
giving them greater control over the investments placed within their accounts. Where clients may 
prefer a non-discretionary investment management arrangement, we may still use portfolios 
recommended by our firm with the client retaining final decision making authority concerning whether 
the recommended trades are placed within their account. The majority of Old Mission Investment 
Company client accounts have granted discretionary investment management authority of their 
accounts.
 
For clients granting Old Mission Investment Company discretionary authority, we are responsible for 
major investment decisions, including but not limited to the following: the security to be purchased or 
sold, the amount to be bought or sold, and the brokerage firm used to execute the transaction. Asset 
allocation decisions for each client are the primary factor in determining the amount of each transaction
on behalf of the clients' account. While we expect to use mutual funds as a primary investment vehicle,
in transactions involving individual securities we strive to select a broker dealer based on best 
execution, service, accuracy and transaction fees.
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IRA Rollover Recommendations
Effective December 20, 2021 (or such later date as the US Department of Labor ("DOL") Field 
Assistance Bulletin 2018-02 ceases to be in effect), for purposes of complying with the DOL's 
Prohibited Transaction Exemption 2020-02 ("PTE 2020-02") where applicable, we are providing the 
following acknowledgment to you.
 
When we provide investment advice to you regarding your retirement plan account or individual 
retirement account, we are fiduciaries within the meaning of Title I of the Employee Retirement Income
Security Act and/or the Internal Revenue Code, as applicable, which are laws governing retirement 
accounts. The way we make money creates some conflicts with your interests, so we operate under a 
special rule that requires us to act in your best interest and not put our interest ahead of yours. Under 
this special rule's provisions, we must:
 

• Meet a professional standard of care when making investment recommendations (give prudent 
advice); 

• Never put our financial interests ahead of yours when making recommendations (give loyal 
advice); 

• Avoid misleading statements about conflicts of interest, fees, and investments; 
• Follow policies and procedures designed to ensure that we give advice that is in your best 

interest; 
• Charge no more than is reasonable for our services; and 
• Give you basic information about conflicts of interest. 

 
We benefit financially from the rollover of your assets from a retirement account to an account that we 
manage or provide investment advice, because the assets increase our assets under management 
and, in turn, our advisory fees. As a fiduciary, we only recommend a rollover when we believe it is in 
your best interest.
 
Wrap Fee Programs:
 
Old Mission Investment Company does not participate in any wrap fee programs with another 
custodian or investment manager.
 
Managed Assets:
 
Old Mission Investment Company has the following assets under management as of December 31, 
2024:
Discretionary Basis:  $754,445,545
Non-Discretionary Basis:  $136,392,519
Total Assets under Management:  $890,838,064
 

Item 5 Fees and Compensation 
 
Description
 
As a fee-based investment advisory firm, Old Mission Investment Company provides clients with fee-
based investment solutions that provide transparency with respect to our compensation. Clients are 
billed on an asset-based fee structure that can be as low as .25% to as high as 1.75% of the assets 
under our management. Advisory fees are assessed on the total value of the portfolios we manage, 
which may include cash assets such as money market accounts. Fees are negotiable based on the 
size and scope of the client relationship.
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For clients maintaining substantial cash balances through money market accounts, we may make 
additional accommodations whereby a client may maintain money market assets on a non-investment 
basis, through an affiliated non-fee account. This is done to accommodate clients' needs for checking 
account services, with investment management services provided through another account.
 
Billing
 
Fees are charged quarterly in advance (prior to services provided) and each invoice will be based 
upon the market value of the portfolio, set forth by the custodian, as of the last market day of the 
relevant calendar month. Clients may pay fees separately by check or may have fees debited from 
their account by signing an investment advisory agreement or new account paperwork from the 
custodian permitting this action. For clients seeking to engage Old Mission Investment Company for 
financial planning or consultation services may be billed for these services at a rate between $150 and 
$275 per hour depending on the complexity and scope of the project. Additionally, clients may engage 
Old Mission Investment Company on a 'project basis' with fees ranging from $500 to $10,000.
 
Other Fees
 
Fidelity Investments ("Fidelity") is the principal investment custodian for our clients' accounts and does 
not charge an annual custodial fee for this service. Fidelity is compensated through transaction fees 
generated through trading initiated by our firm, fees charged for wire transfers from client accounts, 
and margin interest charged to clients who wish to borrow against their portfolios. Fidelity may also 
receive a portion of the advisory fees charged by the money market funds, mutual funds, or exchange 
traded funds held within client accounts. Clients of Old Mission Investment Company will incur the 
following charges:
 
Quarterly fees paid to Old Mission Investment Company (between .25% and 1.75% annually of assets 
under management), commissions or transaction charges paid to Fidelity to purchase or sell individual 
securities or mutual funds, and fees to fund managers for ongoing management of mutual funds, 
money market funds, and exchanged traded funds.
 
The fees paid to Old Mission Investment Company as well as the fees paid to Fidelity Investments for 
advisory and transaction purposes, respectively, are disclosed on all client statements from our 
custodian. Underlying mutual fund expenses, referred to as 'internal operating expenses', may be 
deducted on a daily basis from mutual fund assets and are generally not visible to clients. This 
information is available through a fund's prospectus, or upon request to our firm.
 
Compensation for Sales of Investment Products or Services
 
Old Mission Investment Company does not receive any compensation for the sale of any security or 
investment product recommended or purchased for its clients.
 

Item 6 Performance-Based Fees and Side-By-Side Management 
 
Old Mission Investment Company does not charge any performance-based fees. All fees are disclosed
above.
 

Item 7 Types of Clients/Minimum Account Size 
 
Old Mission Investment Company provides financial planning, consulting, and investment management
services to individuals, pension and profit sharing plans, trusts, estates, charitable organizations, 
corporations and business entities. We do not enforce a minimum account size for our client 

6 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



relationships; however, we place a high value on relationships that retain the services of our firm on a 
comprehensive basis. Clients with specific needs such as alternative investments or separate account 
managers may have to meet the needs of the outside advisor separate from the requirement of Old 
Mission Investment Company. This is evaluated on a case-by-case basis. Presently, Old Mission 
Investment Company serves clients, families, and institutions with the majority of portfolios ranging 
from $100,000 to $50,000,000.
 

Item 8 Methods of Analysis, Investment Strategies and Risk of Loss 
 
Methods of Analysis
 
Old Mission Investment Company utilizes fundamental analysis in the formulation of client portfolios 
and investment models for client accounts. We rely upon information obtained from a variety of 
different sources including, but not limited to, Morningstar, Zack's Investment Research, Goldman 
Sachs, and other research prepared by others.
 
Investment Strategies
 
Old Mission Investment Company generally utilizes investments made across a variety of different 
assets classes, such as domestic large company and small company stocks, international stocks, fixed
income, convertible securities and alternative asset classes. Asset allocation is an important part of 
each portfolio, with each portfolio allocation driven by the clients' tolerance for risk, the investor's time 
horizon, and need for income. We do utilize a model portfolio strategy, providing for similar securities 
for each portfolio; however, each portfolio may have characteristics that differ from one portfolio to 
another based on the clients' preference for maintaining certain levels of cash, or a request to exclude 
certain assets from the model allocation.
 
We presently maintain 6 model portfolio allocations for our clients, with the majority of client funds 
invested within non-proprietary mutual funds and/or exchange traded funds. We recommend that all 
clients consider a strategy that favors asset allocation and the use of mutual fund investments. We feel
that mutual funds or exchanged traded funds provide clients with the best way to achieve portfolio 
diversification, with immediate and efficient access to a variety of different asset classes.
 
We prefer to advise clients that long-term investing (5 years or longer) may provide the best chance at 
success. We cannot, however, guarantee the effectiveness of our advice, nor can we control the 
outcome of any investment method, including conservative portfolio model allocations. Market 
conditions may dictate changes to our investment philosophy and as a result we may make occasional 
changes to our clients' portfolios. Even though we do not regard transactions fees as a significant 
charge to our client portfolios, we do advocate a low-turnover, long-term investment strategy for client 
accounts.
 
Risk of Loss
 
As mentioned above, we cannot guarantee the accuracy of the advice we provide. Losses can occur 
with any investment made, or within any strategy utilized, conservative or otherwise. Clients are 
requested to advise our firm of any change to their personal or financial circumstance that may change
their tolerance for risk and sensitivity to loss. The risk of loss within any security or investment we 
recommend other than government securities, is 100%.
 

Item 9 Disciplinary Information 
 
Old Mission Investment Company and its employees do not have any disciplinary actions to report.
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Item 10 Other Financial Industry Activities and Affiliations 
 
Members of Old Mission may hold insurance licenses permitting them to sell or recommend 
commission-based insurance products or services to clients of Old Mission Investment Company.
 
The principals of Old Mission Investment Company also own Old Mission Trust Company, a privately-
held independent trust company chartered under the laws of South Dakota. Old Mission Trust 
Company is considered an affiliate of Old Mission Investment Company. Clients of Old Mission 
Investment Company may be solicited by Old Mission Trust Company.
 
No client of Old Mission Investment Company may engage the services of Old Mission Trust Company
at the same time where Old Mission Trust Company is serving as trustee. Clients who wish to engage 
the services of Old Mission Trust Company may do so by terminating services with the investment 
advisor, and engaging the services of Old Mission Trust Company. Should Old Mission Trust Company
assume trustee duties for a client of Old Mission Investment Company, Old Mission Trust Company 
will immediately terminate the advisory relationship with Old Mission Investment Company. Investment 
management services provided to Old Mission Trust Company clients are done exclusively through 
Old Mission Trust Company, and not through Old Mission Investment Company. The employees of Old
Mission Investment Company are also employees of Old Mission Trust Company, and may be 
compensated by Old Mission Trust Company for referring advisory clients to Old Mission Trust 
Company when trust services are required. Employees and representatives of Old Mission Investment 
Company may work for both companies. There is a contract between the two companies that allows 
them to share administrative staff, equipment and other typical business resources.
 
Old Mission Trust Company is owned directly by the members of Old Mission Investment Company 
LLC and not Old Mission Investment Company. Old Mission Trust Company does not act as custodian 
for any assets belonging to clients of Old Mission Investment Company. Additional information about 
Old Mission Trust Company may be found by contacting the State of South Dakota Division of 
Banking.
 

Item 11 Code of Ethics, Participation or Interest in Client Transactions and 
Personal Trading 
 
Code of Ethics
 
Old Mission Investment Company strives to maintain the highest standards of business ethics. We 
conduct business in a proper and legal manner and expect our employees to do the same. In most 
instances, the proper course of action is apparent and we follow it. Compliance with all regulation and 
legislation is of paramount importance to the firm and its employees as well as to the reputation of the 
Firm and its principles of honesty, integrity and professionalism.
 
Old Mission Investment Company has established a Code of Ethics which establishes standards of 
conduct for all personnel in our employ, protects material non-public information about our clients' 
transactions and requires the reporting of personal securities transactions. We offer a copy of our 
Code of Ethics to all clients on an annual basis and also provide a copy to each prospective client 
before signing our investment advisory contract.
 
We place our clients' interests first and foremost in all matters. In addition, all of our personnel must 
comply with applicable federal securities laws.
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Unless express consent is given by the client:
 

• We never divulge conversations in any form (oral or written) between our clients and ourselves. 
 

• We never make public any information regarding a client's wealth or holdings. 
 
Participation or Interest in Client Transactions
 
We may recommend to clients securities in which we or a related party has a material financial 
interest.
 
Old Mission Investment Company may, from time to time, invest in the same securities that we 
recommend to clients. This could result in a potential conflict of interest if we were to time the 
purchases in the client accounts to benefit our personal trading. Within our Code of Ethics, as it relates
to Personal Trading, we restrict trading in the same securities as our clients within a reasonable time 
period.
 
From time to time, we may recommend certain securities to clients who retain discretion over their 
investment portfolios which we recently purchased for our personal accounts. In those cases, our Code
of Ethics requires us to disclose the transactions in the personal accounts to our clients before 
conducting the trade in the client's account.
 

Item 12 Brokerage Practices 
 
Old Mission Investment Company does recommend that clients engage Fidelity Investments as an 
investment custodian, and to transact trades for their accounts. Fidelity does provide access to 
institutional trading and custody services not readily available to retail investors. These services are 
generally available to registered investment advisors on an unsolicited basis without charge to the 
advisor, provided the aggregate value of the advisor's clients' assets exceed $20 million on the Fidelity 
Institutional Wealth Services platform These services include brokerage, custody, research, and 
access to institutional share classes of mutual funds only available to investors with large initial 
minimum investments typically exceeding $1 million.
 
Fidelity Investments also makes available other products and services that may benefit Old Mission 
Investment Company but may not benefit its clients' accounts. Some of these products and services 
aid Old Mission Investment Company in the management of client accounts. This relationship creates 
a conflict of interest since recommending other custodians may increase the operational costs for Old 
Mission Investment Company in the servicing of client accounts. These products or services may 
include, but are not limited to the following: research, the ability to deduct advisory fees from clients' 
custodial accounts, pricing information, assistance with back-office functions, discounts on periodicals 
or materials, fee waivers for conferences, complimentary business and compliance newsletters, and 
various other non-cash services.
 
Recommending that clients maintain accounts with Fidelity Investments may be based on benefits 
provided to Old Mission Investment Company from Fidelity Investments and that the decision to utilize 
Fidelity may be based on other factors and not just the costs or quality of the services provided to 
clients of Old Mission Investment Company by Fidelity Investments.
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While we generally custody our clients' assets at Fidelity Investments, we are allowed to "trade away" 
utilizing broker dealers other than Fidelity if it is in their best interests. As a fiduciary for our clients, we 
attempt to obtain the best execution for each trade transacted for our clients. Best execution usually 
considers the underlying cost to our clients, but may also include timeliness, liquidity, accuracy and 
other factors.
 
While we prefer to have clients custody assets through Fidelity Investments, clients who ask us to 
manage assets at a different custodian will be permitted to do so assuming the custodian can provide 
a comparable level of products and services when compared to Fidelity Investments.
 
Soft Dollar Relationships 
 
Old Mission Investment Company does not have soft dollar arrangements as we believe these 
arrangements would not be in our client's best interests.
 
Directed Brokerage
 
Fidelity does not provide any client referrals to Old Mission Investment Company in exchange for the 
recommendation for clients to utilize custodial services through Fidelity. It is our policy not to require 
clients to direct trades through a specific broker dealer, known as 'directed brokerage.
 

Item 13 Review of Accounts 
 
Periodic Reviews
 
All client accounts are reviewed on a continuous and ongoing basis. Internal reviews of portfolio assets
are done on a quarterly, monthly, perhaps even daily basis by members of the Old Mission Investment 
Committee, in addition to the other advisory representatives of Old Mission. The Investment 
Committee is comprised of a one person committee that includes Christopher Lamb as the Chief 
Investment Officer. Client portfolio reviews can be conducted on an intra-month basis, upon request or 
appointment. Client reviews routinely include reviews of specific account performance and asset 
allocation, with broad-based reviews of specific security performance. We may make comparisons to 
specific index returns and may also reference other items such as financial plans in evaluating the 
goals and objectives of a client account.
 
Portfolio models are reviewed each day by members of the Old Mission Investment Committee. Other 
reviews, as mentioned above, may be done on a monthly basis to include specific fund or security 
performance relative to appropriate benchmarks, and a review of the asset allocation of the fund model
against the target asset allocation.
 
Factors That Trigger Review
 
A review may be warranted based on actions such as: client request, additional deposits to the client 
account, change in client risk tolerance, goals or objectives, and changes in the economic climate or 
expected returns of certain asset classes that may warrant changes in the overall strategy for the 
model portfolio or client account. Additionally, changes in clients' tax situation, or the overall tax laws 
may cause a specific account review.
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Client Reports
 
Clients receive standard account statements from investment sponsors and qualified brokerage firms 
monthly or quarterly and as transactions occur. Old Mission Investment Company prepares quarterly 
portfolio reports for clients. Clients are encouraged to carefully compare the information on Old Mission
Investment Company reports to that on the custodian's statements.
 
Copies of our clients' internally generated reports are maintained at our office in an electronic format. 
In addition, client statements generated from Fidelity are kept in our office in electronic format and can 
also be accessed by clients through the custodian's website.
 

Item 14 Client Referrals and Other Compensation 
 
Old Mission Investment Company may compensate certain non-employee individuals and institutions 
for the referral of clients. These individuals and entities are referred to as "solicitors." In these 
situations, there will be a written agreement with the soliciting individual or organization that specifies 
the amount of the compensation they will receive. This compensation does not affect the fees that a 
client will pay and any client referred to Old Mission Investment Company by a solicitor are provided by
a written disclosure with details of any compensation arrangement between Old Mission and the 
soliciting individual or organization prior to signing any agreement with Old Mission Investment 
Company. As of the date of this agreement, we presently maintain referral relationships with 
Charlevoix State Bankand Honor State Bank (Michigan-based banking institutions through which Old 
Mission Investment Company provides services to the banks' depositors and shareholders for a 
referral fee). Old Mission Trust Company also engages in referral fee arrangements but does not 
compensate Old Mission Investment Company for any referrals.
 
Old Mission Investment Company, LLC ("Old Mission") is the lessee of a commercial office building in 
Petoskey, Michigan. The location is disclosed on Old Mission's Form ADV Part 1 as an "other office 
location," although only administrative activities are performed there. Old Mission has a solicitor 
arrangement with Honor State Bank ("the Bank") whereby Old Mission provides compensation to the 
Bank in the form of a referral fee in exchange for the Bank recommending the advisory services of Old 
Mission to its depositors. The referral fee is a percentage of the fees collected from those clients 
referred to Old Mission by the Bank. Old Mission has offered the Bank a short-term sub-lease for the 
available office space in the Petoskey building. Although the sub-lease is offered on terms comparable 
with other commercial space in the area, this does, nevertheless, present a conflict of interest since it 
provides an additional incentive for the Bank to recommend the advisory services of Old Mission. 
Depositors of the Bank are under no obligation to use the advisory services of any investment adviser 
recommended to them by the Bank.
 
 

Item 15 Custody 
 
Old Mission Investment Company does not take custody of client's assets; rather, we use Fidelity 
Investments as the custodian. In its role as custodian, Fidelity Investments provides monthly report 
statements to all of our clients.
 

Item 16 Investment Discretion 
 
Old Mission Investment Company exercises investment discretion in the selection of securities to be 
bought or sold for client accounts based on clients' individual investment objectives and the analysis 
performed by the Old Mission Investment Company investment committee. From time to time, clients 

11 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



may engage the services of our firm on a discretionary basis but would like to be notified prior to any 
changes being made within their account. On an individual basis, clients may have investment 
discretion within their own account, or any other account they are authorized by the account owner or 
authorized person.
 

Item 17 Voting Client Securities 
 
Old Mission Investment Company does not vote proxies on behalf of clients. Our investment custodian,
Fidelity, will forward any proxies that need to be voted to the individual account owners or their 
authorized individuals.
 

Item 18 Financial Information 
 
Old Mission Investment Company does not have any financial condition that will impair the firm from 
meeting contractual commitments to our clients. A balance sheet is not required to be provided 
because a.) Old Mission Investment Company does not serve as a custodian for client accounts, and 
b.) does not require prepayment of investment advisory fees of more than $1,200 six months or more 
in advance.
 

Item 19 Requirements for State-Registered Advisers 
 
We are a federally registered investment adviser; therefore, we are not required to respond to this 
item.
 

Item 20 Privacy Policy and Additional Information 
 
Old Mission Investment Company as a Registered Investment Adviser is covered under the definition 
of a "financial institution" under the Gramm-Leach-Bliley Act, ("The Act") and in conjunction with the 
SEC's Privacy Rule ("Regulation S-P"). The Privacy Rule requires every broker, dealer, investment 
company, and registered investment adviser to adopt policies and procedures reasonably designed to 
safeguard customer records and other nonpublic consumer information.
 
Old Mission Investment Company utilizes information that you provide in order to provide you with the 
services and information you request and it is our goal to deliver the best possible service to you, while
guarding against any real or perceived infringements of your rights of privacy. The types of information 
the Adviser may collect during the normal course of business may include: Information provided in 
applications, forms, and provided either verbally or in writing, and include but are not limited to your 
name, address, phone number, account information, social security number, employment, assets, 
income and debt; information about your transactions, accounts, balance information; trading activity, 
parties to transactions; Information from other outside sources, medical and beneficiary information 
(relating to insurance issues), conversations between clients and Advisory Representatives, and any 
other information deemed to be nonpublic personal as defined by the Act and by state privacy rules.
 
Old Mission Investment Company realizes that providing personal information is an act of trust and 
takes the issue of protecting privacy seriously. The Adviser values clients' trust and confidence and will
never sell or share nonpublic personal information obtained from consumers or clients. All information 
provided by clients to Old Mission Investment Company and information and advice furnished by the 
Adviser to clients, shall be treated as confidential and shall not be disclosed to unaffiliated third parties,
except as permitted by clients with written authorization, by application to facilitate the investment 
advisory services offered by the Adviser via an unaffiliated financial services provider, to a supervising 
entity (such as the Adviser's unaffiliated broker/dealer, PKS) or as required by law or by any regulatory 
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authority to which the Adviser or its associated persons may be subject. For example, we may be 
required to turn over information in order to cooperate with law enforcement authorities and/or 
securities regulators.
 
Old Mission Investment Company limits access of nonpublic information to only those who require the 
information for the delivery of advisory or administrative services and who have been educated about 
and have signed an acknowledgment of our privacy policies. The Adviser's policy to protect client 
information extends beyond the termination of the client agreement. Additionally:
 

• We maintain a secure office and computer environment to ensure that your information is not 
placed at unreasonable risk. 

 
• We do not provide your personally identifiable information to mailing list vendors or solicitors for

any purpose. 
 

• Personally identifiable information about you will be maintained and protected during the time 
you are a client, and for the required time thereafter that such records required to be 
maintained by securities laws (5 years) and thereafter will be safely destroyed via in-house 
shredding or a secure shredding services. 

 
If consumers provide the Adviser with nonpublic personal information but do not become clients, the 
Adviser may keep this information securely on file for up to a year before shredding in-house or via a 
secure shredding service, depending upon the nature of the information and the likelihood of 
engagement.
 
Clients are encouraged to discuss any questions regarding Old Mission Investment Company's privacy
policies and procedures directly with Jeffrey Johnson, the Chief Compliance Officer of Old Mission 
Investment Company.
 
Trade Errors
In the event a trading error occurs in your account, our policy is to restore your account to the position 
it should have been in had the trading error not occurred. Depending on the circumstances, corrective 
actions may include canceling the trade, adjusting an allocation, and/or reimbursing the account. All 
profits resulting from a trade error will be given to the client.  All losses will be paid for by Old Mission 
Investment Co.
 
Class Action Lawsuits
We do not determine if securities held by you are the subject of a class action lawsuit or whether you 
are eligible to participate in class action settlements or litigation nor do we initiate or participate in 
litigation to recover damages on your behalf for injuries as a result of actions, misconduct, or 
negligence by issuers of securities held by you.
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Old Mission Investment Company, LLC 
880 Munson Avenue, Suite B
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Traverse City, MI 49686

  
   

Telephone: 231-929-4100 
Facsimile: 231-929-4190

 
 

www.omico.net
  
  
 
 

 February 7, 2022
  
  
  

FORM ADV PART 2B 
BROCHURE SUPPLEMENT 

 
 
 
This brochure provides information about Jeffrey A. Johnson that supplements Old Mission Investment
Company ("Old Mission") brochure. You should have received a copy of that brochure. Please contact 
Christopher Lamb at (231) 929-4100 if you did not receive a copy of that brochure or if you have any 
questions about the contents of this supplement.
 
Additional information about Jeffrey A. Johnson is available on the SEC's website at 
www.adviserinfo.sec.gov.
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Item 2 Educational Background and Business Experience 
 
Mr. Johnson was born in 1966. He graduated in 1989 from Northwood University, Midland Michigan 
and presently holds a B.S. in Economics.
 
Mr. Johnson is the Chief Compliance Officer, Principal and member of Old Mission Investment 
Company LLC since its creation in 2006, and had previous employment with Prudential Securities, and
Wachovia Securities as a Financial Advisor and Branch Manager prior to establishing Old Mission 
Investment Company.
 
He successfully passed the FINRA Series 65 Uniform Investment Adviser State Law Exam, Series 63 
Uniform Securities Agent State Law Exam, and the FINRA Series 7 Exam in 1998. Additionally Mr. 
Johnson holds the FINRA Series 9 and 10 licenses.
 

Item 3 Disciplinary Information 
 
Mr. Johnson does not have any disciplinary information to disclose. Not including his divorce, he has 
not: (a) been party to a criminal or civil action in a domestic, foreign or military court, (b) been party to 
an administrative proceeding before the SEC, any other federal regulatory agency, any state regulatory
agency or any foreign financial regulatory authority; or (c) been party to a self-regulatory proceeding.
 

Item 4 Other Business Activities 
 
Mr. Johnson holds his insurance license as an insurance agent within the State of Michigan. Mr. 
Johnson is also a Vice President of Old Mission Trust Company, an affiliate of Old Mission Investment 
Company.
 

Item 5 Additional Compensation 
 
Mr. Johnson does receive compensation in addition to commission-based compensation through the 
sale of insurance-related products and services as a licensed insurance agent through the State of 
Michigan.
 

Item 6 Supervision 
 
Mr. Johnson is supervised by Christopher Lamb, Chief Executive Officer for Old Mission Investment 
Company. His contact information can be found on the cover page of this brochure supplement.
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Lindsay Fitzpatrick, CFP® 
 
 
  

Old Mission Investment Company, LLC 
  880 Munson Ave., Suite B

Traverse City, MI 49686
 
 
 

Telephone: 231-929-4100
Facsimile: 231-929-4190 

 
 

 www.omico.net
 
 
 
 

June 14, 2019
 
 
 

FORM ADV PART 2B
BROCHURE SUPPLEMENT

 
 
 
This brochure supplement provides information about Lindsay Fitzpatrick that supplements Old 
Mission Investment Company ("Old Mission") brochure. You should have received a copy of that 
brochure. Please contact Jeffrey Johnson at (231) 929-4100 if you did not receive a copy of that 
brochure or if you have any questions about the contents of this supplement.
 
Additional information about Lindsay Fitzpatrick is available on the SEC's website at 
www.adviserinfo.sec.gov. 
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Form ADV Brochure Supplement for Lindsay Fitzpatrick, CFP®

 

Item 2 Educational Background and Business Experience 
 
Ms. Fitzpatrick was born in 1987. She graduated in 2006 from Alpena Community College with an AA 
in Business Management, in 2010 from Michigan State University with a BA in Hospitality Business 
and in 2012 from DePaul University with a Certificate Financial Planning Certificate Program. Ms. 
Fitzpatrick has been attending College for Financial Planning since 2017 and is studying for a MS in 
Personal Financial Planning.
 
Ms. Fitzpatrick is a Vice President of Investments and Financial Planning & Investment Adviser 
Representative of Old Mission Investment Company LLC since 2019. She has a previous employment 
with Rehmann as a Financial Advisor and a Registered Assistant of Royal Alliance. She currently holds
her CFP® Designation. 
 
The CERTIFIED FINANCIAL PLANNERTM, CFP® and federally registered CFP® (with flame design) 
marks (collectively, the "CFP® marks") are professional certification marks granted in the United States 
by Certified Financial Planner Board of Standards, Inc. ("CFP Board").
 
The CFP® certification is a voluntary certification; no federal or state law or regulation requires financial
planners to hold CFP® certification. It is recognized in the United States and a number of other 
countries for its (1) high standard of professional education; (2) stringent code of conduct and 
standards of practice; and (3) ethical requirements that govern professional engagements with clients. 
Currently, more than 71,000 individuals have obtained CFP® certification in the United States.
 
To attain the right to use the CFP® marks, an individual must satisfactorily fulfill the following 
requirements:
 

• Education – Complete an advanced college-level course of study addressing the financial 
planning subject areas that CFP Board's studies have determined as necessary for the 
competent and professional delivery of financial planning services, and attain a Bachelor's 
Degree from a regionally accredited United States college or university (or its equivalent from a 
foreign university). CFP Board's financial planning subject areas include insurance planning 
and risk management, employee benefits planning, investment planning, income tax planning, 
retirement planning, and estate planning; 

• Examination – Pass the comprehensive CFP® Certification Examination. The examination 
includes case studies and client scenarios designed to test one's ability to correctly diagnose 
financial planning issues and apply one's knowledge of financial planning to real world 
circumstances; 

• Experience – Complete at least three years of full-time financial planning-related experience (or
the equivalent, measured as 2,000 hours per year); and 

• Ethics – Agree to be bound by CFP Board's Standards of Professional Conduct, a set of 
documents outlining the ethical and practice standards for CFP® professionals. 

 
Individuals who become certified must complete the following ongoing education and ethics 
requirements in order to maintain the right to continue to use the CFP® marks:
 

• Continuing Education – Complete 30 hours of continuing education hours every two years, 
including two hours on the Code of Ethics and other parts of the Standards of Professional 
Conduct, to maintain competence and keep up with developments in the financial planning field;
and 

• Ethics – Renew an agreement to be bound by the Standards of Professional Conduct. 
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The Standards prominently require that CFP® professionals provide financial planning services 
at a fiduciary standard of care. This means CFP® professionals must provide financial planning 
services in the best interests of their clients. 

 
CFP® professionals who fail to comply with the above standards and requirements may be subject to 
CFP Board's enforcement process, which could result in suspension or permanent revocation of their 
CFP® certification.
 

Item 3 Disciplinary Information 
 
Ms. Fitzpatrick does not have any disciplinary information to disclose. He has not: (a) been party to a 
criminal or civil action in a domestic, foreign or military court, (b) been party to an administrative 
proceeding before the SEC, any other federal regulatory agency, any state regulatory agency or any 
foreign financial regulatory authority; or (c) been party to a self-regulatory proceeding. 
 

Item 4 Other Business Activities 
 
Lindsay Fitzpatrick is separately licensed as an independent insurance agent. In this capacity, she can 
effect transactions in insurance products for her clients and earn commissions for these activities. The 
fees you pay our firm for advisory services are separate and distinct from the commissions earned by 
Ms. Fitzpatrick for insurance related activities. This presents a conflict of interest because Ms. 
Fitzpatrick may have an incentive to recommend insurance products to you for the purpose of 
generating commissions rather than solely based on your needs. However, you are under no 
obligation, contractually or otherwise, to purchase insurance products through any person affiliated 
with our firm.  
 
Lindsay Fitzpatrick is an Vice President of Investments and Financial Planning of Old Mission 
Investment Company, a registered investment adviser. When appropriate, Ms. Fitzpatrick may 
recommend that you use the investment advisory services of Old Mission Investment Company. If you 
utilize the advisory services of Ms. Fitzpatrick through Old Mission Investment Company, she may 
receive additional fees or other compensation in her capacity as an investment adviser representative. 
These fees would be in addition to any fees charged for the advisory services provided through Old 
Mission Investment Company, LLC.  
 
Lindsay Fitzpatrick is Finance Committee Board Member of YMCA Great Lakes Bay Region, a Non-
Profit. Ms. Fitzpatrick's duties as the Finance Committee Board Member of YMCA Great Lakes Bay 
Region do not create a conflict of interest to her provision of advisory services through Old Mission 
Investment Company, LLC.    
 

Item 5 Additional Compensation 
 
Refer to the Other Business Activities section above for disclosures on Ms. Fitzpatrick's receipt of 
additional compensation as a result of her other business activities.  
 
Also, refer to the Fees and Compensation, Client Referrals and Other Compensation, and Other 
Financial Industry Activities and Affiliations section(s) of Old Mission Investment Company, LLC's firm 
brochure for additional disclosures on this topic. 
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Item 6 Supervision 
 
Ms. Fitzpatrick s supervised by Jeffrey Johnson, Chief Compliance Officer for Old Mission Investment 
Company. His contact information can be found on the cover page of this brochure supplement.
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Ryan William Knabusch
 
 
 

Old Mission Investment Company, LLC 
  

880 Munson Ave.
Suite B

Traverse City, MI 49686
 
 
 

Telephone: 231-929-4100
Facsimile: 231-929-4190 

 
 

www.omico.net 
 
 

April 30, 2025 
 
 
 

FORM ADV PART 2B
BROCHURE SUPPLEMENT

 
 
 
This brochure supplement provides information about Ryan William Knabusch that supplements the 
Old Mission Investment Company, LLC brochure. You should have received a copy of that brochure. 
Contact us at 231-929-4100 if you did not receive Old Mission Investment Company, LLC's brochure or
if you have any questions about the contents of this supplement.
 
Additional information about Ryan William Knabusch (CRD # 6763184) is available on the SEC's 
website at www.adviserinfo.sec.gov. 
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Item 2 Educational Background and Business Experience 
 
Ryan William Knabusch
Year of Birth: 1986
Formal Education After High School:

• University of Toledo, MBA Finance, 2012. 
• Eastern Michigan University, BA Business Administration, 2008

Business Background:
• Old Mission Investment Company, LLC, Investment Advisor Representative, 3/2025 - Present 
• Sandbox Financial Partners, VP, Wealth Advisor, 6/2024 - 3/2025 
• Sculati Wealth Management, LLC, Financial Advisor, 11/2018 - 5/2024 
• Plante Moran Financial Advisors, Institutional Consultant, 3/2015 - 8/2018 
• Monroe Bank & Trust, Credit Analyst, 11/2013 - 3/2015 

 
Certifications: CPFA 
 
Certified Plan Fiduciary Advisor (CPFA)
The CPFA designation demonstrates an individuals knowledge, expertise and commitment to working 
with retirement plans. Plan advisers who earn their CPFA demonstrate the expertise required to act as 
a plan fiduciary or help plan fiduciaries manage their roles and responsibilities. To receive the CPFA 
designation, individuals must successfully pass the CPFA Examination. In order to maintain the CPFA 
designation, the individual must complete 20 continuing education credits bi-annually. The certification 
is administered by the National Association of Plan Advisers.
 

Item 3 Disciplinary Information 
 
Mr. Knabusch does not have any reportable disciplinary disclosure.
 

Item 4 Other Business Activities 
 
Ryan Knabusch  is a Member of the Finance Committee and Chair of the Endowment Committee of 
Leelanau Children's Center. He serves for a three-year term and his duties include attending Board 
and Committee meetings, leading Committee meetings when needed, and attending community 
meetings and events.
 

Item 5 Additional Compensation 
 
Ryan William Knabusch does not receive any additional compensation beyond that received as an 
Investment Advisor Representative of Old Mission Investment Company, LLC.
 

Item 6 Supervision 
 
Mr. Knabusch is supervised by Jeffrey Johnson, Chief Compliance Officer for Old Mission Investment 
Company. His contact information can be found on the cover page of this brochure supplement.
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Christopher M. Lamb, CIMA, CTFA
  
  
  

Old Mission Investment Company, LLC 
880 Munson Avenue, Suite B

Traverse City, MI 49686
  
   

Telephone: 231-929-4100 
Facsimile: 231-929-4190

 
 

www.omico.net
  
  
 
 

June 29, 2021
  
  
  

FORM ADV PART 2B 
BROCHURE SUPPLEMENT 

 
 
 
This brochure supplement provides information about Christopher M. Lamb that supplements the Old 
Mission Investment Company ("Old Mission") brochure. You should have received a copy of that 
brochure.  Please contact Jeffrey Johnson at (231) 929-4100 if you did not receive a copy of that 
brochure or if you have any questions about the contents of this supplement.
 
Additional information about Christopher M. Lamb is available on the SEC's website at 
www.adviserinfo.sec.gov.
 
 
 
 
 
Form ADV Brochure Supplement for Christopher M. Lamb, CIMA, CTFA
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Item 2 Educational Background and Business Experience 
 
Mr. Lamb was born in 1971. He graduated in 1993 from Albion College in Albion, Michigan and 
presently holds a B.A. in Economics and Management. Mr. Lamb holds the designation Certified 
Investment Management Analyst (CIMA) from the Investment Management Consultant's Association 
following coursework and evaluation at the Wharton School of Business in August of 2000.
 
Additionally, Mr. Lamb holds the Certified Trust and Financial Advisor Designation (CTFA) from the 
Institute of Certified Bankers (ICB). He obtained the CTFA designation following coursework and 
evaluation by the National Trust School through the American Banker's Association and the ICB in 
October of 2010.
 
Both the CIMA and CTFA designations require continuing education coursework to be completed 
every 2 years in areas of concentration that include but are not limited to: Taxation, estate planning, 
investment management, ethics, probate administration, trust administration, manager search, and 
performance evaluation.
 
Mr. Lamb is the Chief Executive Officer, Principal and member of Old Mission Investment Company 
LLC since its creation in 2006. He has had previous employment with Prudential Securities, and 
Wachovia Securities as a Financial Advisor and Vice President of Investments prior to establishing Old
Mission Investment Company.
 
He successfully passed the FINRA Series 65 Uniform Investment Adviser State Law Exam, Series 63 
Uniform Securities Agent State Law Exam, and the FINRA Series 7 Exam in 1993.
 

Item 3 Disciplinary Information 
 
Mr. Lamb does not have any disciplinary information to disclose. He has not: (a) been party to a 
criminal or civil action in a domestic, foreign or military court, (b) been party to an administrative 
proceeding before the SEC, any other federal regulatory agency, any state regulatory agency or any 
foreign financial regulatory authority; or (c) been party to a self-regulatory proceeding.
 

Item 4 Other Business Activities 
 
Mr. Lamb is the President and Chief Executive Officer of Old Mission Trust Company, an affiliate of 
Old Mission Investment Company.
 

Item 5 Additional Compensation 
 
Mr. Lamb does not receive any additional compensation from a non-client in connection with providing 
advisory services through Old Mission Investment Company, LLC.
 

Item 6 Supervision 
 
Mr. Lamb is supervised by Jeffrey Johnson, Chief Compliance Officer for Old Mission Investment 
Company. His contact information can be found on the cover page of this brochure supplement.
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Keith P. Olshove, AIF 
 
 
 

Old Mission Investment Company, LLC 
880 Munson Ave.

Suite B
Traverse City, MI 49686 

 
 
 

Telephone: 231-929-4100
Facsimile: 231-929-4190

 
 
 

www.omico.net 
 
 

June 29, 2021
 
 
 

FORM ADV PART 2B
BROCHURE SUPPLEMENT

 
 
 
This brochure supplement provides information about Keith P. Olshove that supplements the Old 
Mission Investment Company, LLC brochure. You should have received a copy of that brochure. 
Contact us at 231-929-4100 if you did not receive Old Mission Investment Company, LLC's brochure or
if you have any questions about the contents of this supplement.
 
Additional information about Keith P. Olshove (CRD # 1624335) is available on the SEC's website at 
www.adviserinfo.sec.gov.
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Item 2 Educational Background and Business Experience 
 
Keith P. Olshove, AIF 
Year of Birth: 1964
Formal Education After High School:

• Western Michigan University, BBA Finance, 1986 
Business Background:

• Old Mission Investment Company, LLC, Investment Adviser Representative, 4/2014 - Present 
• Northwestern Bank, Trust Officer, 4/1991 - 3/2014 

 
Certifications: AIF
 
Accredited Investment Fiduciary® (AIF®) 
The AIF designation certifies that the recipient has specialized knowledge of fiduciary standards of 
care and their application to the investment management process. To receive the AIF designation, 
individuals must complete a training program, successfully pass a comprehensive, closed-book final 
examination under the supervision of a proctor and agree to abide by the AIF Code of Ethics. In order 
to maintain the AIF designation, the individual must annually renew their affirmation of the AIF Code of 
Ethics and complete six hours of continuing education credits. The certification is administered by the 
Center for Fiduciary Studies, LLC (a Fiduciary360 (fi360) company). 
 

Item 3 Disciplinary Information 
 
Form ADV Part 2B requires disclosure of certain criminal or civil actions, administrative proceedings, 
and self-regulatory organization proceedings, as well as certain other proceedings related to 
suspension or revocation of a professional attainment, designation, or license. Mr. Keith P. 
Olshove has no required disclosures under this item.
 

Item 4 Other Business Activities 
 
Keith P. Olshove serves on the investment committee of Old Mission Trust Company, serving as a 
member of the committee.  Services provided include trust administration, investment management, 
tax management and other related fiduciary services commensurate with his participation in OMT.
 

Item 5 Additional Compensation 
 
Mr. Olshove does not receive any additional compensation beyond that received as an Investment 
Adviser Representative of Old Mission Investment Company, LLC.
 

Item 6 Supervision 
 
Mr. Olshove is supervised by Jeffrey Johnson, Chief Compliance Officer for Old Mission Investment 
Company.  His contact information can be found on the cover page of this brochure supplement.
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Kurt A. Schuler 
  
  
  

Old Mission Investment Company, LLC 
880 Munson Avenue, Suite B

Traverse City, MI 49686
  
  
  

Telephone: 231-929-4100 
Facsimile: 231-929-4190

 
 

www.omico.net
  
  
 
 

June 29, 2021
  
  
  

FORM ADV PART 2B 
BROCHURE SUPPLEMENT 

 
 
 
This brochure provides information about Kurt A. Schuler that supplements Old Mission Investment 
Company ("Old Mission") brochure. You should have received a copy of that brochure. Please contact 
Jeffrey Johnson at (231) 929-4100 if you did not receive a copy of that brochure or if you have any 
questions about the contents of this supplement.
 
Additional information about Kurt A. Schuler is available on the SEC's website at 
www.adviserinfo.sec.gov.
 
 
 
 
 
Form ADV Brochure Supplement for Kurt A. Schuler 
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Item 2 Educational Background and Business Experience 
 
Mr. Schuler was born in 1963. He graduated in 1985 from Denison University in Granville, Ohio and 
presently holds a B.A. in Economics.
 
Mr. Schuler is the Chief Information Officer, Principal and member of Old Mission Investment Company
LLC since its creation in 2006, and had previous employment with Prudential Securities, and Wachovia
Securities as a Financial Advisor and Vice President of Investments prior to establishing Old Mission 
Investment Company.
 
He successfully passed the FINRA Series 65 Uniform Investment Adviser State Law Exam, Series 63 
Uniform Securities Agent State Law Exam, and the FINRA Series 7 Exam in 1992.
 

Item 3 Disciplinary Information 
 
Mr. Schuler does not have any disciplinary information to disclose. Not including his divorce, he has 
not: (a) been party to a criminal or civil action in a domestic, foreign or military court, (b) been party to 
an administrative proceeding before the SEC, any other federal regulatory agency, any state regulatory
agency or any foreign financial regulatory authority; or (c) been party to a self-regulatory proceeding.
 

Item 4 Other Business Activities 
 
Mr. Schuler is the a Vice President and Chief Information Officer of Old Mission Trust Company, an 
affiliate of Old Mission Investment Company.
 

Item 5 Additional Compensation 
 
Mr. Schuler does not receive any additional compensation beyond that received as an Investment 
Adviser of Old Mission Investment Company, LLC. 
 

Item 6 Supervision 
 
Mr. Schuler is supervised by Jeffrey Johnson, Chief Compliance Officer for Old Mission Investment 
Company. His contact information can be found on the cover page of this brochure supplement.
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Carey A. Tafelsky, CFP®

 
 
 

Old Mission Investment Company, LLC 
880 Munson Ave.

Suite B
Traverse City, MI 49686

 
 
 

Telephone: 231-929-4100
Facsimile: 231-929-4190

 
 

 www.omico.net
 
 

June 29, 2021
 
 
 

FORM ADV PART 2B
BROCHURE SUPPLEMENT

 
 
 
This brochure supplement provides information about Carey A. Tafelsky that supplements the Old 
Mission Investment Company, LLC brochure. You should have received a copy of that brochure. 
Contact us at 231-929-4100 if you did not receive Old Mission Investment Company, LLC's brochure or
if you have any questions about the contents of this supplement.
 
Additional information about Carey A. Tafelsky (CRD# 6456688) is available on the SEC's website at 
www.adviserinfo.sec.gov.
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Item 2 Educational Background and Business Experience 
 
Carey A. Tafelsky
Year of Birth: 1983
Formal Education After High School:

• Aquinas College, Grand Rapids, MI, BA International Business, 8/2001 - 5/2006 
Business Background:

• Old Mission Investment Company, LLC, Investment Adviser, 10/2014 - Present 
• Lake Michigan Financial Corporation (Bank of Holland Holding Co), Business Resource 

Lending Representative, 7/2012 - 7/2014 
• The Bank of Holland, Commercial Credit Analyst, 1/2011 - 7/2012 
• Mercantile Bank of Michigan, Commercial Loan Assistant, 5/2007 - 1/2011 

 
Certifications: CFP
 
The CERTIFIED FINANCIAL PLANNERTM, CFP® and federally registered CFP® (with flame design) 
marks (collectively, the "CFP® marks") are professional certification marks granted in the United States 
by Certified Financial Planner Board of Standards, Inc. ("CFP Board").
 
The CFP® certification is a voluntary certification; no federal or state law or regulation requires financial
planners to hold CFP® certification. It is recognized in the United States and a number of other 
countries for its (1) high standard of professional education; (2) stringent code of conduct and 
standards of practice; and (3) ethical requirements that govern professional engagements with clients. 
Currently, more than 71,000 individuals have obtained CFP® certification in the United States.
 
To attain the right to use the CFP® marks, an individual must satisfactorily fulfill the following 
requirements:
 

• Education – Complete an advanced college-level course of study addressing the financial 
planning subject areas that CFP Board's studies have determined as necessary for the 
competent and professional delivery of financial planning services, and attain a Bachelor's 
Degree from a regionally accredited United States college or university (or its equivalent from a 
foreign university). CFP Board's financial planning subject areas include insurance planning 
and risk management, employee benefits planning, investment planning, income tax planning, 
retirement planning, and estate planning; 

• Examination – Pass the comprehensive CFP® Certification Examination. The examination 
includes case studies and client scenarios designed to test one's ability to correctly diagnose 
financial planning issues and apply one's knowledge of financial planning to real world 
circumstances; 

• Experience – Complete at least three years of full-time financial planning-related experience (or
the equivalent, measured as 2,000 hours per year); and 

• Ethics – Agree to be bound by CFP Board's Standards of Professional Conduct, a set of 
documents outlining the ethical and practice standards for CFP® professionals. 

 
Individuals who become certified must complete the following ongoing education and ethics 
requirements in order to maintain the right to continue to use the CFP® marks:
 

• Continuing Education – Complete 30 hours of continuing education hours every two years, 
including two hours on the Code of Ethics and other parts of the Standards of Professional 
Conduct, to maintain competence and keep up with developments in the financial planning field;
and 

• Ethics – Renew an agreement to be bound by the Standards of Professional Conduct. 

2 
 

©2017 National Compliance Services 800-800-3204 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



The Standards prominently require that CFP® professionals provide financial planning services 
at a fiduciary standard of care. This means CFP® professionals must provide financial planning 
services in the best interests of their clients. 

 
CFP® professionals who fail to comply with the above standards and requirements may be subject to 
CFP Board's enforcement process, which could result in suspension or permanent revocation of their 
CFP® certification.
 

Item 3 Disciplinary Information 
 
Ms. Tafelsky does not have any reportable disciplinary disclosure.
 

Item 4 Other Business Activities 
 
Ms. Tafelsky serves on the investment committee of Old Mission Trust Company, serving as a member
of the committee.  Services provided include trust administration, investment management, tax 
management and other related fiduciary services commensurate with her participation in OMT.
 

Item 5 Additional Compensation 
 
Ms. Tafelsky does not receive any additional compensation beyond that received as an Investment 
Adviser of Old Mission Investment Company, LLC.
 

Item 6 Supervision 
 
Ms. Tafelsky is supervised by Jeffrey Johnson, Chief Compliance Officer for Old Mission Investment 
Company. His contact information can be found on the cover page of this brochure supplement.
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Susan Wipperman, JD, CFP®

 
 
  

Old Mission Investment Company, LLC 
  

880 Munson Ave.
Suite B

Traverse City, MI 49686 
 
 
 

Telephone: 231-929-4100
Facsimile: 231-929-4190 

 
 

www.omico.net
 
 

June 29, 2021
 
 
 

FORM ADV PART 2B
BROCHURE SUPPLEMENT

 
 
 
This brochure supplement provides information about Susan Wipperman that supplements the Old 
Mission Investment Company, LLC brochure. You should have received a copy of that brochure. 
Contact us at 231-929-4100 if you did not receive Old Mission Investment Company, LLC's brochure or
if you have any questions about the contents of this supplement.
 
Additional information about Susan Wipperman (CRD # 6875113) is available on the SEC's website at 
www.adviserinfo.sec.gov. 
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Item 2 Educational Background and Business Experience 
 
Susan Wipperman
Year of Birth: 1962
Formal Education After High School:

• Wayne State University, JD, 9/1989 - 5/1992 
• University of Michigan , BBA Finance, 9/1985 - 5/1987 

Business Background:
• Old Mission Investment Company, LLC, Investment Adviser Representative, 10/2017 - Present 
• Fifth Third Bank, Team Lead and Senior Trust Officer, 2/2005 - 10/2017 

 
Certifications: CFP
 
The CERTIFIED FINANCIAL PLANNERTM, CFP® and federally registered CFP® (with flame design) 
marks (collectively, the "CFP® marks") are professional certification marks granted in the United States 
by Certified Financial Planner Board of Standards, Inc. ("CFP Board").
 
The CFP® certification is a voluntary certification; no federal or state law or regulation requires financial
planners to hold CFP® certification. It is recognized in the United States and a number of other 
countries for its (1) high standard of professional education; (2) stringent code of conduct and 
standards of practice; and (3) ethical requirements that govern professional engagements with clients. 
Currently, more than 71,000 individuals have obtained CFP® certification in the United States.
 
To attain the right to use the CFP® marks, an individual must satisfactorily fulfill the following 
requirements:
 

• Education – Complete an advanced college-level course of study addressing the financial 
planning subject areas that CFP Board's studies have determined as necessary for the 
competent and professional delivery of financial planning services, and attain a Bachelor's 
Degree from a regionally accredited United States college or university (or its equivalent from a 
foreign university). CFP Board's financial planning subject areas include insurance planning 
and risk management, employee benefits planning, investment planning, income tax planning, 
retirement planning, and estate planning; 

• Examination – Pass the comprehensive CFP® Certification Examination. The examination 
includes case studies and client scenarios designed to test one's ability to correctly diagnose 
financial planning issues and apply one's knowledge of financial planning to real world 
circumstances; 

• Experience – Complete at least three years of full-time financial planning-related experience (or
the equivalent, measured as 2,000 hours per year); and 

• Ethics – Agree to be bound by CFP Board's Standards of Professional Conduct, a set of 
documents outlining the ethical and practice standards for CFP® professionals. 

 
Individuals who become certified must complete the following ongoing education and ethics 
requirements in order to maintain the right to continue to use the CFP® marks:
 

• Continuing Education – Complete 30 hours of continuing education hours every two years, 
including two hours on the Code of Ethics and other parts of the Standards of Professional 
Conduct, to maintain competence and keep up with developments in the financial planning field;
and 

• Ethics – Renew an agreement to be bound by the Standards of Professional Conduct. 
The Standards prominently require that CFP® professionals provide financial planning services 
at a fiduciary standard of care. This means CFP® professionals must provide financial planning 
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services in the best interests of their clients. 
 
CFP® professionals who fail to comply with the above standards and requirements may be subject to 
CFP Board's enforcement process, which could result in suspension or permanent revocation of their 
CFP® certification.
 

Item 3 Disciplinary Information 
 
Ms. Wipperman does not have any reportable disciplinary disclosure.
 

Item 4 Other Business Activities 
 
Ms. Wipperman serves on the investment committee of Old Mission Trust Company, serving as a 
member of the committee.  Services provided include trust administration, investment management, 
tax management and other related fiduciary services commensurate with her participation in OMT.
 

Item 5 Additional Compensation 
 
Ms. Wipperman does not receive any additional compensation from a non-client in connection with 
providing advisory services through Old Mission Investment Company, LLC.
 

Item 6 Supervision 
 
Ms. Wipperman is supervised by Jeffrey Johnson, Chief Compliance Officer for Old Mission 
Investment Company. His contact information can be found on the cover page of this brochure 
supplement.
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